K-12

Subcommittee

Tuesday, November 3, 2015
9:00 AM -11:00 AM
Morris Hall (17 HOB)

Meeting Packet

Steve Crisafulli Janet Adkins
Speaker Chair



II.

III.

IV.

AGENDA

K-12 Subcommittee
Tuesday, November 3, 2015
9:00 AM. —-11:00 AM.
Morris Hall (17 HOB)

Call to Order/Roll Call
Welcome/Opening Remarks
Consideration of the following bills:

e HB 119 Educational Facilities by Bileca
e HB 287 Principle Autonomy Pilot Program Initiative by Diaz, M

Workshop
e Legislation Regarding Struggling Readers

Closing Remarks and Adjournment



HB 119



FLORIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI VE S

HB 119 2016

1 A bill to be entitled

2 An act relating to educational facilities; creating s.

3 1013.385, F.S.; providing for school district

4 construction flexibility; authorizing exceptions to

5 educational facilities construction requirements under

6 certain circumstances; providing an effective date.

7

8| Be It Enacted by the Legislature of the State of Florida:

9

10 Section 1. Section 1013.385, Florida Statutes, 1s created
11| to read:

12 1013.385 School district construction flexibility.—

13 (1) A district school board may, with a supermajority vote
14| at a public meeting that begins no earlier than 5 p.m., adopt a
15 resolution to implement one or more of the exceptions to the

16| educaticnal facilities construction requirements provided in

17| this section. Before voting on the resolution, a district school
18| board must conduct a cost-benefit analysis prepared according to
19| a prcfessionally accepted methodology that describes how each

20| exception selected by the district school board achieves cost
21 savings, improves the efficient use of school district
22} resources, and impacts the life-cycle costs and life span for
23 each educational facility to be constructed, as applicable, and
24| demonstrates that implementation of the exception will not
25| compromise student safety or the quality of student instruction.
26y The district school board must conduct at least one public

Page 1 of 3

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb0119-00



F L ORIDA H O U S E O F REPRESENTATI VE S

HB 119 2016

27| workshop to discuss and receive public comment on the proposed

28| resolution and cost-benefit analysis, which must begin no

29| earlier than 5 p.m. and may occur at the same meeting at which

30| the resolution will be voted upon.

31 (2) A resolution adopted under this section may propose

32 implementation of exceptions to requirements of the uniform

33| statewide building code for the planning and construction of

34| public educational and ancillary plants adopted pursuant to ss.

35| 553.73 and 1013.37 relating to:

36 (a) Interior nonload-bearing walls, by approving the use

37 of fire-rated wood stud walls in new construction or remodeling

38 for interior nonload-bearing wall assemblies that will not be

39} exposed to water or located in wet areas.

40 (b) Walkways, roadways, driveways, and parking areas, by

41| approving the use of designated, stabilized, and well-drained

42| gravel or grassed student parking areas.

43 (c) Standards for relocatables used as classroom space, as

441 specified in s. 1013.20, by approving construction

451 specifications for installation of relocatable buildings that do

46| not have covered walkways leading to the permanent buildings

47 onsite.

48 (d) Site lighting, by approving construction

49| specifications regarding site lighting that:

50 1. Do not provide for lighting of gravel or grassed

51| auxiliary or student parking areas.

52 2. Provide lighting for walkways, roadways, driveways,

Page 2 of 3

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb0119-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R EPRESTENTATIVE S

HB 119 , 2016
53| paved parking lots, exterior stairs, ramps, and walkways from
54| the exterior of the building to a public walkway through
55| installation of a timer that is set to provide lighting only
56| during periods when the site is occupied.

57 3. Allow lighting for building entrances and exits to be
58| installed with a timer that is set to provide lighting only
59| during periods in which the building is occupied. The minimum
60| illumination level at single-door exits may be reduced to no
61| less than 1 footcandle.
62 Section 2. This act shall take effect July 1, 2016.

Page 3 of 3

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb0119-00



HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES STAFF ANALYSIS

BILL #: HB 119 Educational Facilities
SPONSOR(S): Bileca and others
TIED BILLS: IDEN./SIM. BILLS: SB 442
REFERENCE ACTION ANALYST STAFF DIRECTOR or

BUDGET/POLICY CHIEF

1) K-12 Subcommittee Brin&g FudgéYV
|

2) Education Committee

SUMMARY ANALYSIS

The uniform statewide building code for the planning and construction of public educational and ancillary
plants, i.e., the State Requirements for Educational Facilities (SREF), is adopted by the Florida Building
Commission as part of the Florida Building Code. The Department of Education (DOE) must biennially review
and recommend to the Florida Building Commission updates and revisions to the SREF. The law and State
Board of Education rules require district school boards to adhere to the SREF when planning and constructing
educational facilities and ancillary plants. Generally speaking, SREF standards are premised on providing
enhanced safety of occupants and increasing the life span of the extensive, publicly funded infrastructure of
Florida’s public school districts.

The bill authorizes a district school board to adopt a resolution to implement an exception to one or more of the
following SREF requirements regarding:

Use of wood studs in interior nonload-bearing walls;

Paved walkways, roadways, driveways, and parking areas;
Covered walkways for relocatable buildings; and

Site lighting.

The resolution must pass by a supermajority vote at a public meeting that begins no earlier than 5 p.m. Before
voting on the resolution, a district school board must conduct a cost-benefit analysis prepared according to a
professionally accepted methodology that describes how each exception selected by the district school board:

e Achieves cost savings;
e Improves the efficient use of school district resources; and
* Impacts the life-cycle costs and life span for each educational facility to be constructed.

The cost-benefit analysis must also demonstrate that implementation of the exception will not compromise
student safety or the quality of student instruction. The district school board must conduct at least one public
workshop to discuss and receive public comment on the proposed resolution and cost-benefit analysis, which
must begin no earlier than 5 p.m. and may occur at the same meeting at which the resolution will be voted
upon.

The bill does not have a fiscal impact on state government. District school boards that take advantage of the
facilities flexibility may achieve cost savings. See Fiscal Analysis & Economic Impact Statement.

The bill is effective July 1, 2016.

This document does not refiect the intent or official position of the bill sponsor or House of Representatives.
STORAGE NAME: h0119.KTS.DOCX
DATE: 10/23/2015



FULL ANALYSIS
I. SUBSTANTIVE ANALYSIS

A. EFFECT OF PROPOSED CHANGES:
Present Situation

State Requirements for Educational Facilities

The uniform statewide building code for the planning and construction of public educational and
ancillary plants, i.e., the State Requirements for Educational Facilities (SREF), is adopted by the
Florida Building Commission as part of the Florida Building Code.' The Department of Education (DOE)
must biennially review and recommend to the Florida Building Commission updates and revisions to
the provisions of the SREF of the Florida Building Code.? The law and State Board of Education rules
require district school boards and Florida College System (FCS) institution boards of trustees to adhere
to the SREF when planning and constructing educational facilities and ancillary plants.® Generally
speaking, SREF standards are premised on providing enhanced safety of occupants and increasing the
life span of the extensive, publicly funded infrastructure of Florida’s public school districts.*

Currently, the SREF is codified in s. 453 of the Florida Building Code, 5™ Edition. Among other things,
the SREF specifies the following standards for interior walls; walks, roads, drives, and parking areas;
covered walks; and site lighting:

SREF of the Florida Building Code®
453.8.3.1.1: Interior nonload-bearing wood studs or partitions shall not be used in permanent
educational and auxiliary facilities or relocatable buildings
453.10.2: Walks, roads, drives, and parking areas. Walks, roads, drives, and parking areas
on educational and ancillary sites shall be paved. Roads, drives, and parking areas shall be
in compliance with Department of Transportation (DOT) road specifications and striped in
compliance with DOT paint specifications. All paved areas shall have positive drainage.
453.10.2.1: Covered walks. All buildings in K-12 educational facilities shall be connected by
paved walks and accessible under continuous roof cover. New relocatable classroom
buildings shall be connected to permanent buildings by paved covered walks where
applicable.
453.10.3: Site lighting required. Design, construction, and installation of exterior security
lighting for educational and ancillary facilities shall be provided for:

* Auto, bus, and service drives and loading areas;
Parking areas;
Building perimeter; and
Covered and connector walks between buildings and between buildings and parking.

Effect of Proposed Changes

The bill authorizes a district school board to adopt a resolution to implement an exception to one or
more of the following SREF requirements:

' Section 1013.37(1), E.S.

? Section 1013.37(4), F.S.

? Section 1013.37(1), F.S.; rule 6A-2.0010, F.A.C.

* See, e.g., s. 1013.12 (casualty, safety, sanitation, and firesafety standards and inspection of property) and 1013.451, F.S. (life-cycle
cost comparison)

* International Code Council, Florida Building Code 5" Edition (2014) Building,

http://codes.icesafe.org/app/book/content/2014 Florida/Building%20Code/Chapter%204.html (last visited October 27,2015) (see s.

453 State Requirements for Educational Facilities).
STORAGE NAME: h0119.KTS.DOCX PAGE: 2
DATE: 10/23/2015




e Interior nonload-bearing walls by approving the use of fire-rated wood stud walls in new
construction or remodeling for interior nonload-bearing wall assemblies that will not be exposed
to water or located in wet areas.

» Walkways, roadways, driveways, and parking areas by approving the use of designated,
stabilized, and well-drained gravel or grassed student parking areas.

e Standards for relocatables used as classroom space by approving construction specifications
for installation of relocatable buildings that do not have covered walkways leading to the
permanent buildings onsite.

» Site lighting by approving construction specifications regarding site lighting that:

o Do not provide for lighting of gravel or grassed auxiliary or student parking areas.

o Provide lighting for walkways, roadways, driveways, paved parking lots, exterior stairs,
ramps, and walkways from the exterior of the building to a public walkway through
installation of a timer that is set to provide lighting only during periods when the site is
occupied.

o Allow lighting for building entrances and exits to be installed with a timer that is set to
provide lighting only during periods in which the building is occupied. The minimum
illumination level at single-door exits may be reduced to no less than 1 footcandle.

The resolution must pass by a supermajority vote at a public meeting that begins no earlier than 5 p.m.
Before voting on the resolution, a district school board must conduct a cost-benefit analysis prepared
according to a professionally accepted methodology that describes how each exception selected by the
district school board:

¢ Achieves cost savings;
e Improves the efficient use of school district resources; and
» Impacts the life-cycle costs and life span for each educational facility to be constructed.

The cost-benefit analysis must also demonstrate that implementation of the exception will not
compromise student safety or the quality of student instruction. The district school board must conduct
at least one public workshop to discuss and receive public comment on the proposed resolution and
cost-benefit analysis, which must begin no earlier than 5 p.m. and may occur at the same meeting at
which the resolution will be voted upon.

B. SECTION DIRECTORY:
Section 1. Creates s. 1013.385, F.S,, relating to School district construction flexibility.

Section 2. Provides an effective date of July 1, 2016.

Il. FISCAL ANALYSIS & ECONOMIC IMPACT STATEMENT
A. FISCAL IMPACT ON STATE GOVERNMENT:

1. Revenues:

None.

2. Expenditures:

None.

STORAGE NAME: h0119.KTS.DOCX PAGE: 3
DATE: 10/23/2015



B. FISCAL IMPACT ON LOCAL GOVERNMENTS:

1. Revenues:
None.

2. Expenditures:

District school boards that choose to implement the facilities flexibility authorized by the bill may
achieve cost savings.

C. DIRECT ECONOMIC IMPACT ON PRIVATE SECTOR:
None.

D. FISCAL COMMENTS:
None.

Hl. COMMENTS
A. CONSTITUTIONAL ISSUES:

1. Applicability of Municipality/County Mandates Provision:

Not applicable. This bill does not appear to affect county or municipal governments.

2. Other:

None.

B. RULE-MAKING AUTHORITY:

None.

C. DRAFTING ISSUES OR OTHER COMMENTS:

None.

IV. AMENDMENTS/ COMMITTEE SUBSTITUTE CHANGES
Not applicable.

STORAGE NAME: h0119.KTS.DOCX PAGE: 4
DATE: 10/23/2015



HB 287



O N o0 g w N

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17

DNIION comnerre/supcomurrrse mumnouent

Bill No. HB 287 (2016)
Amendment No. 1

COMMITTEE/SUBCOMMITTEE ACTION

ADOPTED _ (Yy/n)
ADOPTED AS AMENDED _(Y/N)
ADOPTED W/O OBJECTION _(Y/N)
FAILED TO ADOPT _(Y/N)
WITHDRAWN _(Y/N)
OTHER

Committee/Subcommittee hearing bill: K-12 Subcommittee

Representative Diaz, M. offered the following:

Amendment (with title amendment)
Remove lines 156-157 and insert:

additional amount of $10,000 for each participating principal in

each participating district as a salary supplement, a fund for

the principal’s school to be used at the principal’s discretion,

or both, as determined by the district. To be eligible for a

salary supplement under this subsection, a participating

principal must:

1. Be rated “highly effective” as determined by the

principal’s performance evaluation under s. 1012.34;

2. Be transferred to a school that earned a grade of “F”

or three consecutive grades of “D” pursuant to s. 1008.34 and

provided additional authority and responsibilities pursuant to

s. 1012.28(8); and

973811 - h0287-1line 156.docx
Published On: 11/2/2015 4:16:06 PM
Page 1 of 2




UMMM cormsrrres/suscomurrres avenmEnt
Bill No. HB 287 (2016)

18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
277
28

Amendment No. 1

3. Have implemented a school turnaround option under s.

1008.33(4) as the school’s principal. The turnaround option must

have resulted in the school improving by at least one letter

grade while he or she was serving as the school’s principal.

TITLE AMENDMENT
Remove lines 15-16 and insert:
in the pilot program; providing for funding, eligibility
requirements, reporting, and rulemaking; amending s. 1011.69,

F.S.;

973811 - h0287-1line 156.docx

Published On: 11/2/2015 4:16:06 PM
Page 2 of 2




F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATIVE S

HB 287 2016
1 A bill to be entitled
2 An act relating to the Principal Autonomy Pilot
3 Program Initiative; creating s. 1011.6202, F.S.;
4 creating the Principal Autonomy Pilot Program
5 Initiative; providing a procedure for a school
6 district to participate in the pilot program;
7 providing requirements for participating school
8 districts and schools; exempting participating schools
9 from certain laws and rules; requiring principals of
10 participating schools and specified personnel to
11 participate in the University of Virginia School
12 Turnaround Program; providing for the term of
13 participation in the pilot program; providing for
14 renewal or revocation of authorization to participate
15 in the pilot program; providing for funding,
16 reporting, and rulemaking; amending s. 1011.69, F.S.;
17 requiring participating district school boards to
18 allocate a specified percentage of certain funds to
19 participating schools; amending s. 1012.28, F.S.;:
20 providing additional authority and responsibilities of
21 the principal of a participating school; providing an
22 : effective date.
23
24 Be It Enacted by the Legislature of the State of Florida:
25
26 Section 1. Section 1011.6202, Florida Statutes, is created
Page 1 0f8

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb0287-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI VE

HB 287 2016

27 to read:

28 1011.6202 Principal Autonomy Pilot Program Initiative.—The

29 Principal Autonomy Pilot Program Initiative is created within

30 the Department of Education. The purpose of the pilot program is

31 to provide the highly effective principal of a participating

32 school with increased autonomy and authority to operate his or

33 her school in a way that produces significant improvements in

34 student achievement and school management while complying with

35 constitutional reguirements. The State Board of Education may,

36 upon approval of a principal autonomy proposal, enter into a

37| performance contract with up to three district school boards for

38| participation in the pilot program.

39 (1) PARTICIPATING SCHOOL DISTRICTS.—A Florida school

40 district may submit to the state board for approval a principal

41 autonomy proposal that exchanges statutory and rule exemptions

42 for an agreement to meet performance goals established in the

43| proposal. If approved by the state board, the school district

44 shall be eligible to participate in the pilot program for 3

45 vears. At the end of the 3 years, the performance of all

46 participating schools in the school district shall be evaluated.

47 (2) PRINCIPAL AUTONOMY PROPOSAL.—

48 (a) To participate in the pilot program, a school district
49| must:

50 1. IJIdentify three middle or high schools that received at

51 least two school grades of "D" or "F" pursuant to s. 1008.34

52 during the previous 3 school years.

Page 2 of 8

CODING: Words strcken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb0287-00



F LORI DA H O U S E O F R EPRESTENTATI V E S

HB 287 2016

53 2. Identify three principals who have earned a highly

54 effective rating on the prior vear's performance evaluation

55 pursuant to s. 1012.34, one of whom shall be assigned to each of

56| the participating schools.

57 3. Describe the current financial and administrative

58 management of each participating school; identify the areas in

59 which each school principal will have increased fiscal and

60 administrative autonomy, including the authority and

6l responsibilities provided in s. 1012.28(8); and identify the

62 areas in which each participating school will continue to follow

63| district school board fiscal and administrative policies.

64 4. Explain the methods used to identify the educational

65 strengths and needs of the participating school's students and

66 identify how student achievement can be improved.

67 5. Establish performance goals for student achievement, as

68 defined in s. 1008.34(1), and explain how the increased autonomy

69| of principals will help participating schools improve student

70 achievement and school management.

71 6. Provide each participating school's mission and a

72 description of its student population.

73 (b) The state board shall establish criteria, which must

74 include the criteria listed in paragraph (a), for the approval

75 of a principal autonomy proposal.

76 (c) A school district must submit its principal autonomy

77 proposal to the state board for approval by December 1 in order

78 to begin participation in the subsequent school year. By

Page 3 of 8

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb0287-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 287 2016

79 February 28 of the school year in which the proposal is

80 submitted, the state board shall notify the district school

81 board in writing whether the proposal is approved.

82 (3) EXEMPTION FROM LAWS.—
83 (a) With the exception of those laws listed in paragraph
84 (b), a participating school district is exempt from the

85{ provisions of chapters 1000-1013 and rules of the state board

86 that implement those exempt provisions.

87 (b) A participating school district shall comply with the

88 provisions of chapters 1000-1013, and rules of the state board

89! that implement those provisions, pertaining to the following:

90 1. Those laws relating to the election and compensation of

91 district school board members, the election or appointment and

92 compensation of district school superintendents, public meetings

93| and public records reqguirements, financial disclosure, and

94 conflicts of interest.

95 2. Those laws relating to the student assessment program

96| and school grading system, including chapter 1008.

97 3. Those laws relating to the provision of services to

98 students with disabilities.

99 4. Those laws relating to civil rights, including s.

100 1000.05, relating to discrimination.

101 5. Those laws relating to student health, safety, and
102 welfare.

103 6. Section 1001.42(4) (f), relating to the uniform opening

104 date for public schools.

Page 4 of 8

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb0287-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F REPIRESENTATI VE S

HB 287 2016

105 7. Section 1003.03, governing maximum class size, except

106 that the calculation for compliance pursuant to s. 1003.03 is

107 the average at the school level for a participating school.

108 8. Sections 1012.22(1) (c) and 1012.27(2), relating to

109 compensation and salary schedules.

110 9. Section 1012.33(5), relating to workforce reductions

111 for annual contracts for instructional personnel. This

112 subparagraph does not apply to at-will employees.

113 10. Section 1012.335, relating to annual contracts for

114 instructional personnel hired on or after July 1, 2011. This

115 subparagraph does not apply to at-will employees.

116 11. Section 1012.34, relating to personnel evaluation

117 procedures and criteria.

118 12. Those laws pertaining to educational facilities,

119 including chapter 1013, except that s. 1013.20, relating to

120 covered walkways for relocatables, and s. 1013.21, relating to

121 the use of relocatable facilities exceeding 20 years of age, are

122 eligible for exemption.

123 13. Those laws pertaining to participating school

124 districts, including this section and ss. 1011.69(2) and
1251 1012.28(8).
126 (4) PROFESSIONAL DEVELOPMENT.-Each participating school

127 district shall require that the principal of each participating

128 school, a three-member leadership team from each participating

129 school, and district personnel working with each participating

130 school complete the University of Virginia School Turnaround

Page 5 of 8

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb0287-00



F L ORIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 287 2016

131 Program. The reguired personnel must enroll in the University of

132 Virginia School Turnaround Program upon acceptance into the

133 pilot program. Each participating school district shall receive

134 $100,000 from the department for participation in the University

135} of Virginia School Turnaround Program.

136 (5) TERM OF PARTICIPATION.—The state board shall authorize

137 a school district to participate in the pilot program for a

138| period of 3 years commencing with approval of the principal

139| autonomy proposal. Authorization to participate in the pilot

140 program may be renewed upon action of the state board. The state

141 board may revoke authorization to participate in the pilot

142 program if the school district fails to meet the requirements of

143 this section during the 3-year period.

144 {(6) REPORTING.—Each participating school district shall

145 submit an annual report to the state board. The state board

146 shall annually report on the implementation of the Principal

147 Autonomy Pilot Program Initiative. Upon completion of the pilot

148 program's first 3-year term, the Commissioner of Education shall

149 submit to the President of the Senate and the Speaker of the

150 House of Representatives by December 1 a full evaluation of the

151 effectiveness of the pilot program.

152 {7) FUNDING.—The Legislature shall provide an

153 appropriation to the department for the costs of the pilot

154 program, including administrative costs and enrollment costs for

155 the University of Virginia School Turnaround Program, and an

156| additional scholarship of $10,000 to each participating

Page 6 of 8

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb0287-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATIV E S

HB 287 2016

157| pzrincipal to be used at his or her school.

158 (8) RULEMAKING.—The State Board of Education shall adopt

159 rules to administer this section.

160 Section 2. Subsection (2) of section 1011.69, Florida

161 Statutes, 1is amended to read:

162 1011.69 Equity in School-Level Funding Act.—

163 (2) Beginning in the 2003-2004 fiscal year, district

164 school boards shall allocate to schools within the district an
165 average of 90 percent of the funds generated by all schools and
166| guarantee that each school receives at least 80 percent, except

167 schools participating in the Principal Autonomy Pilot Program

168 Initiative under s. 1011.6202 are guaranteed to receive at least

169 90 percent, of the funds generated by that school based upon the

170 Florida Education Finance Program as provided in s. 1011.62 and
171 the General Appropriations Act, including gross state and local
172 funds, discretionary lottery funds, and funds from the school
173] district's current operating discretionary millage levy. Total
174 funding for each school shall be recalculated during the year to
175] reflect the revised calculations under the Florida Education

176 Finance Program by the state and the actual weighted full-time
177 equivalent students reported by the school during the full-time
178| equivalent student survey periods designated by the Commissioner
1791 of Education. If the district school board is providing programs
180 or services to students funded by federal funds, any eligible
181 students enrolled in the schools in the district shall be

182 provided federal funds.

Page 7 of 8

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb0287-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 287 2016

183 Section 3. Subsection (8) is added to section 1012.28,
184 Florida Statutes, to read:

185 1012.28 Public school personnel; duties of school

186| principals.—

187 (8) The principal of a school participating in the

188 Principal Autonomy Pilot Program Initiative under s. 1011.6202

1891 has the following additional authority and responsibilities:

190 {a) In addition to the authority provided in subsection

191 (6), the authority to select qualified instructional persconnel

192 for placement or to refuse to accept the placement or transfer

193 of instructional personnel by the district school

194 superintendent. Placement of instructional personnel at a

195 participating school in a participating school district does not

196 affect the employee's status as a school district employeef

197 (b) The authority to deploy financial resources to school

198| programs at the principal's discretion to help improve student

199 achievement, as defined in s. 1008.34 (1), and meet performance

200 goals identified in the principal autonomy proposal submitted

201 pursuant to s. 1011.6202.

202 {c) To annually provide to the district school

203 superintendent and the district school board a budget for the

204 operation of the participating school that identifies how funds

205 provided pursuant to s. 1011.69(2) are allocated. The school

206 district shall include the budget in the annual report provided

207 to the State Board of Education pursuant to s. 1011.6202(6).

208 Section 4. This act shall take effect July 1, 2016.

Page 8 of 8

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb0287-00



HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES STAFF ANALYSIS

BILL #: HB 287  Principal Autonomy Pilot Program Initiative
SPONSOR(S): Diaz, Jr.
TIED BILLS: IDEN./SIM. BILLS: SB 434
REFERENCE N ACTION ANALYST SIAF_F. DIRECTOR or
BUDGETII;OLICY CHIEF
1) K-12 Subcommittee Cherry =7 Fudge Y
[ Fuodhy

2) Education Appropriations Subcommittee

3) Education Committee

SUMMARY ANALYSIS

The bill establishes the Principal Autonomy Pilot Program Initiative (PAPPI) within the Department of Education
to provide the principals of participating schools in participating school districts with increased autonomy and
authority regarding allocation of resources and staffing. School districts selected for participation in PAPPI are
exempt from the K-20 Education Code and State Board of Education rules, with exceptions. Among other
exemptions, the class size compliance calculation for participating schools is the school-level average, rather
than the individual classroom level.

School district participation in PAPPI is voluntary. School districts seeking to participate in PAPPI must submit
a principal autonomy proposal to the State Board of Education for approval. Among other things, the proposal
must identify three middle or high schools that received at least two school grades of “D” or “F” during the
previous three school years, describe the areas in which increased autonomy will be granted, and state
measurable goals regarding student achievement and operational efficiency. The state board may select up to
three school districts for participation in PAPPI. The initial term of the program is three years.

The bill grants the principals of participating schools greater authority regarding staffing decisions, allocation of
financial resources, and budgeting. Among other things, the principal of a participating school is granted
greater authority to hire qualified instructional personnel or refuse placement or transfer of such personnel.
Before participation in the program may begin, such principals must complete professional development
designed to enable them to implement increased autonomy. Participating school districts must guarantee
participating schools at least 90 percent of the funds generated in the Florida Education Finance Program
(FEFP) by that school. The current minimum guaranteed is 80 percent of such funds.

Participating school districts must annually report measures taken to implement the program and results
achieved to the state board. The Commissioner of Education must submit a full evaluation of the program’s
effectiveness to the President of the Senate and the Speaker of the House of Representatives upon expiration
of the initial three year term.

For an analysis of the bill’s fiscal impact, see FISCAL COMMENTS, infra.

The bill provides an effective date of July 1, 2016.

This document does not reflect the intent or official position of the bill sponsor or House of Representatives.
STORAGE NAME: h0287.KTS.docx
DATE: 10/28/2015



FULL ANALYSIS
I. SUBSTANTIVE ANALYSIS

A. EFFECT OF PROPOSED CHANGES:
Present Situation

Research indicates that school leadership is “second only to classroom instruction among all school-
related factors that contribute to what students learn at school.”" Research also indicates that effective
school leadership plays a critical role in the recruitment and retention of quality teachers.? According to
researchers, “principals can be more effective when there is a district-wide culture of joint responsibility
for achieving shared student outcome goals.” This includes giving principals more autonomy to
implement instructional reforms, budget and allocate resources, and hire a quality instructional team
tailored to the individual needs of his or her school.?

School Principals

“School administrators” include school principals, school directors, career center directors, and
assistant principals.* Among other things, school principals are responsible for:

o Fully supporting the authority of classroom teachers and school bus drivers regarding student
discipline and conduct.

* Providing instructional leadership in the development, revision, and implementation of a school
improvement plan.

» Accurate and timely compliance with statutory reporting requirements.

e The management and care of instructional materials.

e Facilitating parental involvement in their child’s education and providing information to parents
regarding their child’s educational progress and available educational choices.®

When filling instructional positions® at the school level, the district school superintendent must consider
nominations received from school principals of the respective schools in the school district. The
superintendent then must make recommendations to the district school board regarding each position
to be filled and the persons to fill such positions. The school board has discretion to approve or reject
any of the superintendent’s recommendations. Before transferring a classroom teacher from one school
to another, the superintendent must consult with the principal of the receiving school and allow the
principal to review the teacher’s records, student performance results,” and interview the teacher. If, a
principal believes students would not benefit from the placement, he or she may request an alternative
placement subject to the approval by the superintendent.? However, the superintendent must accept

! Kenneth Leithwood, et. al., How Leadership Influences Student Learning, Ontario Institute for Studies in Education, at 5 (2004),
available at http://www.wallacefoundation.org/knowledge-center/school-leadership/kev-research/Documents/How—Leadership—
Influences-Student-Learning.pdf.

? The Wallace Foundation, Leading From Every Seat, Empowering Principals to Cultivate Teacher Leadership for School
Improvement, at 4 (2015), available at http://www.newleaders.org/wp-content/uploads/L eadingFromEverySeat pdf.

? Ikemato, Gina, et. al., Great Principals At Scale: Creating District Conditions That Enable All Principals to Be Effective, The Bush
Institute, at 9-11 (June, 2014), available at http://www.newleaders.org/wp-content/uploads/GPAS FullReport_Final.pdf.

4 See s. 1012.01(3), F.S. Administrative personnel are K-12 personnel who perform management activities such as developing and
executing broad policies for the school district. Administrative personnel include district-based instructional and non-instructional
administrators, as well as school administrators who perform administrative duties at the school-level. Id

* Section 1001.54, F.S.

® Instructional personnel include classroom teachers; staff who provide student personnel services, e.g., guidance counselors, social
workers, career specialists, and school psychologists; librarians and media specialists; other instructional staff, e.g., learning resource
specialists; and education paraprofessionals under the direct supervision of instructional personnel. Section 1012.01(2), F.S.

7 As measured by the instructional personnel’s performance evaluation. Section 1012.28(6), F.S.

8 Section 1012.27(1)(b), F.S.
STORAGE NAME: h0287.KTS.docx PAGE: 2
DATE: 10/28/2015




the principal’s decision to refuse placement or transfer of instructional personnel if the instructional
personnel has a performance evaluation rating of needs improvement or unsatisfactory.’

The Florida Principal Leadership Standards

The Florida Principal Leadership Standards (FPLS) are Florida’s core expectations for effective school
administrators, including school principals. The FPLS are research-based:; represent necessary
knowledge, skills, and abilities for effective school leadership; and are the basis for school administrator
performance evaluations, professional development systems, preparation programs, and certification
requirements. The FPLS emphasize ability to improve student learning resuits; development and
retention of quality classroom teachers; and school management practices that promote student
learning, effective allocation of resources, and efficient operations.

Performance Evaluation

Florida law requires each district school superintendent to establish procedures to evaluate the job
performance of district instructional, administrative, and supervisory personnel." Instructional
personnel and school administrators must be evaluated annually, with exceptions.'? School district
performance evaluation systems must differentiate among four levels of performance:

¢ Highly effective;
Effective;

¢ Needs improvement, or for instructional personnel in their first three years of employment who
need improvement, developing; and

e Unsatisfactory.™

The criteria used to measure school administrator performance are student performance, instructional
leadership, and professional and job responsibilities.’ At least one-third of a school administrator's
evaluation must be based upon student performance, with certain exceptions." Student performance
must be measured by statewide assessments'® and, by the 2014-2015 school year for subjects and
grade levels not tested by statewide assessments, local assessments.!” Evaluation of instructional
leadership must include performance measures related to the effectiveness of classroom teachers in
the school, the administrator’s appropriate use of evaluation criteria and procedures, recruitment and
retention of effective and highly effective classroom teachers, improvement in the percentage of
instructional personnel evaluated at the highly effective or effective level, and other leadership practices
that result in student learning growth.™

? Section 1012.28(6), F.S.

' Section 1012.34 F.S. and Rule 6A-5.080(1)-(2), F.A.C.

' Section 1012.34(1)(a), F.S. The term “supervisory personnel” is not defined. See s. 1012.01(3), F.S.

12 See s. 1012.34(3)(a), F.S. Newly hired classroom teachers must be evaluated at least twice in their first year of teaching in the
school district “Newly hired classroom teachers” include first-time teachers new to the profession as well as veteran teachers new to
the school district. Id.

3 Section 1012.34(2)(e), F.S.

' Section 1012.34(3)(a)1., 3., and 4., F.S.

1% Section 1012.34(3)(a)1., F.S If less than three years of data are available, the years for which data are available must be used. The
proportion of growth or achievement data may be determined by instructional assignment. Section 1012.34(3)(a)1.b., F.S.

' The statewide assessment program for public schools includes statewide, standardized assessments for ELA (grades 3-10) and
mathematics (grades 3-8); end-of-course (EOC) assessments for Algebra I, Algebra II, geometry, Biology I, civics, and U.S. History;
and FCAT 2.0 science (grades 5 and 8). Section 1008.22(3)(a)(b), F.S. EOC assessments count 30 percent of a student’s final course
grade. See ss. 1003.4156(1) and 1003.4282(3), F.S.

' Sections 1012.34(3)(a)1. and 1008.22(6), F.S.

'® Section 1012.34(3)(a)3., F.S.
STORAGE NAME: h0287.KTS.docx PAGE: 3
DATE: 10/28/2015



Professional Development

Professional development for school administrators is provided through school district professional
development systems including the William Cecil Golden Professional Development Program for
School Leaders. This program is established in collaboration with state and national professional
leadership organizations and it is designed to respond to Florida’s needs for quality school leadership
and support the efforts of school leaders in improving instruction and student achievement and
developing and retaining quality teachers.'® Professional development provided through the program
must be based upon the FPLS and other school leadership standards.?

The University of Virginia School Turnaround Program is a professional development program for
school-level leaders established in collaboration with the University of Virginia Darden School of
Business and the Curry School of Education.? The program is designed to respond to the needs of
underperforming schools by helping education leaders identify individual key issues and develop
individual strategies to turn around a school. The program focuses on leadership, instructional
infrastructure, differentiated support and accountability, and talent management.??

Effect of Proposed Changes

The bill establishes the Principal Autonomy Pilot Program Initiative (PAPPI) within the Department of
Education (DOE) to provide the principal of a participating school with increased autonomy and
authority regarding allocation of resources and staffing to improve student achievement and school
management. School district participation in PAPPI is voluntary. School districts seeking to participate
in PAPPI must submit a principal autonomy proposal to the State Board of Education for approval. A
proposal must:

* ldentify three middle or high schools that received at least two school grades of “D” or “F” during
the previous three school years.

* Identify three principals who have earned a highly effective rating on the prior year’s
performance evaluations, one of whom shall be assigned to each of the participating schools.
Describe the current financial and administrative management of each participating school;

* Identify the areas in which each school principal will have increased fiscal and administrative
autonomy, including greater autonomy regarding the hiring of instructional personnel.

* Identify the areas in which each participating school will continue to follow district school board
fiscal and administrative policies.

* Explain the methods used to identify the educational strengths and needs of the participating
school's students and identify how student achievement can be improved.

Establish performance goals for student achievement.
Explain how increased principal autonomy will help participating schools improve student
achievement and school management.

e Provide each participating school's mission and a description of its student population.

Based upon these criteria, the state board must approve or deny a school district’s proposal. The bill
authorizes the state board to enter into a performance contract with up to three district school boards
for participation in PAPPI. The term of the program is three years, at which time the performance of all
participating schools in the school district must be evaluated. The state board may revoke a district's
participation in the program during the term of the program and may renew participation upon expiration
of the initial term. The bill specifies deadlines for submission and approval of principal autonomy

'” See ss. 1012. 98(4) and 1012.986, F.S.

20 Section 1012.986(1)-(2), F.S.

2 University of Virginia, Darden/Curry Partnership for Leadership in Education, hitp://www.darden. virginia.edu/darden-curry-
ple/about/ (last visited October 28, 2015).

2 University of Virginia, Darden Partnership for Leadership in Education, available at http://web3.darden.virginia.edu/ple/
STORAGE NAME: h0287.KTS.docx PAGE: 4
DATE: 10/28/2015



proposals and requires the state board to adopt rules for administering PAPPI, including criteria for
approving proposals.

The bill exempts participating school districts from the K-20 Education Code and state board rules
implementing such provisions, except provisions relating to:

» The election and compensation of district school board membeis, the election or appointment
and compensation of district school superintendents, public meetings and public records
requirements, financial disclosure, and conflicts of interest.

* The student assessment program, school grading system, and other school improvement and

accountability requirements.

Students with disabilities.

Civil rights.

Student health, safety, and welfare.

The uniform opening date for public schools.

Maximum class size, except that compliance for a participating school is calculated at the

school-level average, rather than at the individual classroom level.2®

Personnel compensation and salary schedules.

» Workforce reductions for annual contracts for instructional personnel, excluding at-will
employees.

¢ Annual contracts for instructional personnel hired on or after July 1, 2011, excluding at-will
employees.

e Personnel performance evaluations.

 Educational facilities, excluding provisions governing covered walkways for relocatables and
use of relocatable facilities exceeding 20 years of age.

¢ Administration and implementation of PAPPI by participating school districts.

Each participating school district must require the principal of each participating school, a three-
member leadership team from each participating school, and district personnel working with each
participating school to enroll and complete the University of Virginia School Turnaround Program. Each
participating school district shall receive $100,000 from the department for participation in program.

Participating school districts must submit an annual report to the state board regarding program
implementation. Upon completion of the program's first three-year term, the Commissioner of Education
must submit a full evaluation of the program’s effectiveness to the President of the Senate and the
Speaker of the House of Representatives by December 1 of that year. This evaluation will allow the
Legislature to assess the program’s performance and decide whether to continue or repeal the
program.

The bill revises existing law governing the personnel duties of school principals and school budgeting
and calculation of expenditures to facilitate implementation of PAPPI. Currently, a district school
superintendent must consider, but is not bound by, personnel nominations made by school principals.
Furthermore, a school principal may only refuse placement of instructional personnel rated needs
improvement or unsatisfactory on annual performance evaluations. The bill authorizes the principal of a
participating school to:

» Select qualified instructional personnel for placement at the school; and
* Refuse placement or transfer of instructional personnel by the district school superintendent, in
any case.

2 The Florida Constitution provides that class sizes may not exceed 18 students for prekindergarten through 3™ grade; 22 students for
4% through 8™ grades; and 25 students for 9™ through 12" grades. Section 1(a), Art. IX of the State Constitution and s. 1003.03(1), F.S.
The law provides for calculation of class size compliance at the school-level average for public schools of choice, including charter
schools. Sections 1002.31(5) and 1002.33(16)(b)3., F.S.

STORAGE NAME: h0287.KTS.docx PAGE: 5
DATE: 10/28/2015



The bill also provides participating principals greater authority to deploy financial resources and control
over his or her school’s operational budget. Currently, each district school board must allocate to
schools within the district an average of 90 percent of the funds generated by all schools and guarantee
that each school receives at least 80 percent of the funds generated by that school based upon the
Florida Education Finance Program (FEFP), including gross state and local funds, discretionary lottery
funds, and funds fiom the school district's current operating discretionary millage levy. The bill specifies
that schools participating in PAPPI must be guaranteed to receive at least 90 percent of the funds
generated in the FEFP by that school.

B. SECTION DIRECTORY:

Section 1. Creates s. 1011.6202, F.S., relating to the Principal Autonomy Pilot Program Initiative.
Section 2. Amends s. 1011.69, F.S., relating to the Equity in School-Level Funding Act.
Section 3. Amends s. 1012.28, F.S., relating to Public school personnel: duties of school principals.

Section 4. Provides an effective date of July 1, 2016.

Il. FISCAL ANALYSIS & ECONOMIC IMPACT STATEMENT
A. FISCAL IMPACT ON STATE GOVERNMENT:

1. Revenues:
None.

2. Expenditures:
See FISCAL COMMENTS, infra.

B. FISCAL IMPACT ON LOCAL GOVERNMENTS:

1. Revenues:

None.

2. Expenditures:
None.

C. DIRECT ECONOMIC IMPACT ON PRIVATE SECTOR:

None.

D. FISCAL COMMENTS:

The Legislature must appropriate $100,000 to each participating school district for the cost of the pilot
program. This includes costs for the University of Virginia Schoo! Turnaround Program and an
additional scholarship of $10,000 to each participating principal to be used at his or her school. The
maximum cost for the pilot program is $390,000.

STORAGE NAME: h0287.KTS.docx PAGE: 6
DATE: 10/28/2015



Participation in PAPPI is optional. Several of the requirements for participating in PAPPI will impact
budgeting and allocation of resources by participating school districts. Schools participating in PAPPI
must be guaranteed to receive at least 90 percent of the funds generated in the FEFP by that school.
The current minimum guarantee is 80 percent of such funds. The bill also provides principals of those
schools greater authority to deploy financial resources and control over the school’s operational budget.

The bill requires the principals of participating schools to complete additional professional development,
but provides for inclusion of expenses incurred by participating school districts in DOE’s calculation of a
participating school district’s operating expenditures.

Participating school districts may achieve cost savings resulting from the statutory and rule exemptions
granted to them by the bill.

lll. COMMENTS
A. CONSTITUTIONAL ISSUES:

1. Applicability of Municipality/County Mandates Provision:
Not applicable. This bill does not appear to affect county or municipal governments.

2. Other:
None.

B. RULE-MAKING AUTHORITY:

The bill requires the State Board of Education to adopt rules for administering the Principal Autonomy
Pilot Program Initiative, including criteria for approval of school district principal autonomy proposals.

C. DRAFTING ISSUES OR OTHER COMMENTS:

None.

IV. AMENDMENTS/ COMMITTEE SUBSTITUTE CHANGES
Not applicable.

STORAGE NAME: h0287 KTS.docx PAGE: 7
DATE: 10/28/2015



Legislation Regarding
Struggling Readers



F L ORIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATIVES

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR

1 A bill to be entitled

2 An act relating to reading instruction; providing an

3 effective date.

4

5! Be It Enacted by the Legislature of the State of Florida:

6

7 Section 1. Section 1001.215, Florida Statutes, is amended

8 to read:

9 1001.215 Just Read, Florida! Office.—There is created in
10| the Department of Education the Just Read, Florida! Office. The
11| office is shald-be fully accountable to the Commissioner of
12| Education and shall:

13 (1) Train highlyeffeetive reading coaches.
14 (2) Create multiple designations of effective reading
15| instruction, with accompanying credentials, to enable whieh
16| eneeourage all teachers to integrate reading instruction into
17| their content areas.
18 (3) Provide training to FT¥ain K-12 teachers, reading
19| coaches, and school principals on effective content-area-
20| specific reading strategies and explicit, systematic, and
21| multisensory approaches to reading instruction that are proven
22| to improve the reading performance of all students. For
23 secondary teachers, emphasis shall be on technical text. These
24| strategies must be developed for all content areas in the K-12
25| curriculum.
26 (4) Provide parents with information and strategies for
Page 1 of 37
Reading PCB Workshop

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI VES

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR

27| assisting their children in reading, including reading in the

28 content areas a¥ea.

29 (5) Provide technical assistance to school districts in
30{ the development and implementation of district plans for use of
31| the research-based réading instruction allocation provided in s.
32| 1011.62(9) and annually review and approve such plans.

33 (6) Review, evaluate, and provide technical assistance to
34| school districts' implementation of the K-12 comprehensive

35| reading plan required in s. 1011.62(9).

36 (7) Work with the Florida Center for Reading Research to

37| identify effective research-based and evidence-based reading

38| instructional provide—information-—on researeh-based and

39| intervention reading pregrams andeffeetive readingin—the
40| econtent—area strategies. Reading interventions are evidence-

41| Dbased strategies frequently used to remediate reading

42| deficiencies and include individual instruction, tutoring, or

43| mentoring that target specific reading skills and abilities.

44 (8) Periodically review the Next Generation Sunshine State
45| Standards for English language arts reading—at—all-—gradetevels.
46 (9) Periodically review teacher certification requirements

47 and examinations, including alternative certification

48| requirements and eertifieation examinations exams, to ascertain

49| whether the examinations measure the skills needed for evidence-
50| based researeh-based reading instruction and instructional

51| strategies for teaching reading, including reading in the

52 content areas.

Page 2 of 37
Reading PCB Workshop

CODING: Words strcken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



FLORTIDA H O U § E O F R EPRESENTATIVES

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR

53 (10) Work with teacher preparation programs approved

54 pursuant to ss. 1004.04 and 1004.85 s—3664=04 Lo integrate

55| effective, research-based and evidence-based reading

56 instructional and intervention strategies; and reading in the

57 content area instructional strategies; and explicit, systematic,

58| and multisensory reading instructional strategies into teacher

59| preparation programs.

60 (11) Post on its website a list of core and supplemental

61| reading instructional materials for kindergarten through grade 5

62 that meet, at a minimum, all of the following criteria:

63 (a) Use of an explicit, systematic, sequential, and

64| multisensory approach to teaching phonemic awareness, phonics,

65| vocabulary, fluency, and text comprehension.

66 (b) Incorporation of cooperative learning strategies.

67 (c) Incorporation of one-to-one or small group

68| instructional strategies.

69 (d) Incorporation of decodable or phonetic text

70 instructional strategies.

71 (e) Provision of teacher training on well-specified

72 teaching methods and instructional processes designed to

73 implement the materials.

74 (12) 433> Administer grants and perform other functions as
75| necessary. to-—meet—thegoalthat all students—readat—grade

76| Fevel-

77 Section 2. Paragraphs (a) and (b) of subsection (18) of

78 section 1001.42, Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

Page 3 of 37
Reading PCB Workshop

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATIVES

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR

79 1001.42 Powers and duties of district school board.—The
80| district school board, acting as a board, shall exercise all

81| powers and perform all duties listed below:

82 (18) IMPLEMENT SCHOOL IMPROVEMENT AND ACCOUNTABILITY.—

83| Maintain a system of school improvement and education

84| accountability as provided by statute and State Board of

85| Education rule. This system of school improvement and education
86| accountability shall be consistent with, and implemented

87| through, the district's continuing system of planning and

88| budgeting required by this section and ss. 1008.385, 1010.01,
89| and 1011.01. This system of school improvement and education

90| accountability shall comply with the provisions of ss. 1008.33,
91 1008.34, 1008.345, and 1008.385 and include the following:

92 (a) School improvement plans.—

93 1. The district school board shall annually approve and
94 require implementation of a new, amended, or continuation school
95| improvement plan for each school in the district. If a school
96| has a significant gap in achievement on statewide, standardized
97| assessments administered pursuant to s. 1008.22 by one or more
98 student subgroups, as defined in the federal Elementary and

99 Secondary Education Act (ESEA), 20 U.S.C. s.

100! 6311(b) (2) (C) (v) (II); has not significantly increased the

101| percentage of students passing statewide, standardized

102| assessments; has not significantly increased the percentage of
103| students demonstrating Learning Gains, as defined in s. 1008.34

104 and as calculated under s. 1008.34(3) (b), who passed statewide,

Page 4 of 37
Reading PCB Workshop

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



FLORIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI VES

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR

105| standardized assessments; or has significantly lower graduation
106| rates for a subgroup when compared to the state's graduation

107| rate, that school's improvement plan shall include strategies
108 for improving these results. The state board shall adopt rules
109| establishing thresholds and for determining compliance with this
110| subparagraph.

111 2. A school that serves any students from kindergarten

112| through grade ireludes—any—eofgrades—6+—F—e¥ 8 shall include

113| annually in its school improvement plan information and data on

114| the school's early warning system required under paragraph (b),
115| including a list of the early warning indicators used in the
116 system, the number of students identified by the system as

117| exhibiting two or more early warning indicators, the number of
118| students by grade level that exhibit each early warning

119| indicator, and a description of all intervention strategies
120| employed by the school to improve the academic performance of

121| students identified by the early warning system. Ia—additien—a

122| school that—ineludes—any of grades—6—F—or—8—shaltd The plan
123| must also describe in—itssechool improvement—plan the strategies

124| used by the school to implement and evaluate the instructional

125| practices for middle—grades emphasized by the district's
126| professional development system pursuant to s. 1012.98(4) (b)9.

127 and 10.

128 (b) Early warning system.—
129 1. A school that serves any students from kindergarten
130 through grade ineludes—any ofgrades—6+—7F—o¥ 8 shall implement
Page 5 of 37
Reading PCB Workshop

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




FLORIDA H O U S E O F REPRESENTATIVE S

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR

131| an early warning system to identify students in these grades &+
132| F—and-8 who need additional support to improve academic

133| performance and stay engaged in school. The early warning system
134| must include the following early warning indicators:

135 a. Attendance below 90 percent, regardless of whether

136| absence is excused or a result of out-of-school suspension.

137 b. One or more suspensions, whether in school or out of
138 school.

139 c. Course failure in English Language Arts or mathematics

140, during any grading period.

141 d. A Level 1 score on the statewide, standardized
142| assessments in English Language Arts or mathematics, or for

143| students in kindergarten through grade 3, a substantial reading

144| deficiency as determined under s. 1008.25(5) (a).

145
146| A school district may identify additional early warning
147| indicators for use in a school's early warning system.

148 2. A school-based team responsible for implementing the

149| requirements of this paragraph shall monitor the data from the

150! early warning system in subparagraph (a)2. When a student

151| exhibits two or more early warning indicators, the team shall

152

153
154| +this—paragraph-shall ecenvene—to determine, in consultation with

155| the parent, appropriate intervention strategies for the student

156| unless the student is already being served by an intervention

Page 6 of 37
Reading PCB Workshop

CODING: Words siricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



F L ORIDA H O U S E O F REPRESENTATI VES

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR

157| program at the direction of a school-based, multi-disciplinary

158| team. TFhe—school—shall-provide—at—teast—1odayslwritten notice
159 of the meeting tothe student'ls parent,—indicating the meeting's
160 i i 7 ' 7

161| oppertunity to partieipater Data and information relating to a

162| student’s indicators must be used to inform any intervention

163| strategies provided to the student identified under this

l64| paragraph. If a student exhibits a substantial reading

165| deficiency as one of two or more early warning indicators, the

166| school-based team must be consulted in developing an

167| individualized progress monitoring plan for the student pursuant

168 to s. 1008.25(4) (b) if a plan has not yet been developed.

169 Section 3. Subsection (11) of section 1002.20, Florida

170 Statutes, is amended to read:

171 1002.20 K-12 student and parent rights.—Parents of public
172| school students must receive accurate and timely information

173| regarding their child's academic progress and must be informed
174| of ways they can help their child to succeed in school. K-12

175| students and their parents are afforded numerous statutory

176| rights including, but not limited to, the following:

177 (11) STUDENTS WITH READING DEFICIENCIES.—The parent of any

178| K-3 student who exhibits a substantial reading deficiency shall

179| be immediately notified of the student's deficiency pursuant to

180 s. 1008.25(5) and with o deseriptionandexplanation,—in terms
181| understandable—to—the parent;—of the exact natureof the
182| studentls—diffieuvity in tearning and lackofachievement—in

Page 7 of 37

Reading PCB Workshop
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATIVES

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR

183| =xeading; shall be consulted in the development of a plan, as
184| described in s. 1008.25(4) (b) .s—and—shall-be—informed—that—the

185 student—will-be given—intensive reading instruction—until—the
186 deficieneyis—corrected—This subsectionoperates—inadditien—to
187 the remediation—and notification provisions—contained3in s+

188 3106825 and in nowayreduces—the rightsof aparent—oxr—the

189| =xresponsibilitiesof a schooldistriet—under that-seetion-

190 Section 4. Subsection (1) of section 1002.59, Florida

191| Statutes, is amended to read:

192 1002.59 Emergent literacy and performance standards

193| training courses.—

194 (1) The office shall adopt minimum standards for one or
195| more training courses in emergent literacy for prekindergarten
196| instructors. Each course must comprise 5 clock hours and provide
197| instruction in explicit, systematic, and multisensory

198] instruction strategies—andtechnigques to address the age-

199| appropriate progress of prekindergarten students in developing

200 emérgent literacy skills, including oral communication,
201| knowledge of print and letters, phonemic and phonological
202 awareness, and vocabulary and comprehension development. Each

203| course must address early identification and intervention for

204| struggling readers and aise provide resources containing

205| strategies that allow students with disabilities and other
206| special needs to derive maximum benefit from the Voluntary
207| Prekindergarten Education Program. Successful completion of an

208| emergent literacy training course approved under this section

Page 8 of 37
Reading PCB Workshop

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



FLORTIDA H O U § E O F R EPRESENTATI VES

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR

209| satisfies requirements for approved training in early literacy
210| and language development under ss. 402.305(2) (d)5., 402.313(6),
211 and 402.3131(5).

212 Section 5. Paragraph (d) is added to subsection (3) of
213 section 1002.67, Florida Statutes, to read:

214 1002.67 Performance standards; curricula and

215| accountability.—

216 (3)

217 (d) Students who exhibit a deficiency in phonemic

218| awareness, phonics, vocabulary, fluency, or comprehension must

219| be provided intensive, explicit, and systematic instruction.

220 Section 6. Subsection (2) of section 1002.69, Florida

221 Statutes, is amended to read:

222 1002.69 Statewide kindergarten screening; kindergarten

223| readiness rates; state-approved prekindergarten enrollment

224| screening; good cause exemption.-—

225 (2) The statewide kindergarten screening shall provide

226| objective data concerning each student's readiness for

227| kindergarten and progress in attaining the performance standards

228| adopted by the office under s. 1002.67(1). Data from the

229| screening must be used to identify students in need of

230| intervention and support pursuant to s. 1008.25(5).

231 Section 7. Paragraph (b) of subsection (2) of section
232 1004.04, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:
233 1004.04 Public accountability and state approval for

234 teacher preparation programs.-—

Page 9 of 37
Reading PCB Workshop

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATIVES

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR
235 (2) UNIFORM CORE CURRICULA AND CANDIDATE ASSESSMENT.-—
236 (b) The rules to establish uniform core curricula for each

237| state-approved teacher preparation program must include, but are

238| not limited to, the following:

239 1. The Florida Educator Accomplished Practices.
240 2. The state-adopted content standards.
241 3. Scientifically researched reading instruction,

242| including explicit, systematic, and multisensory approaches to

243| reading instruction and intervention that are proven to improve

244| reading performance for all students.

245 4. Content literacy and mathematics practices.

246 5. Strategies appropriate for the instruction of English
247| language learners.

248 6. Strategies appropriate for the instruction of students
249| with disabilities.

250 7. School safety.

251 (¢) Each candidate must receive instruction and be

252| assessed on the uniform core curricula in the candidate’s area

253| or areas of program concentration, including reading instruction

254 under . 1012.567, as applicable, during course work and field

255| experiences.

256 Section 8. Paragraphs (a) and (b) of subsection (3) of
257 section 1004.85, Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

258 1004.85 Postsecondary educator preparation institutes.-—
259 (3) Educator preparation institutes approved pursuant to

260| this section may offer competency-based certification programs

Page 10 of 37
Reading PCB Workshop

CODING: Words stricken are deletions: words underlined are additions.



F L ORIDA H O U S E O F REPRESENTATIVES

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR

261| specifically designed for noneducation major baccalaureate

262| degree holders to enable program participants to meet the

263| educator certification requirements of s. 1012.56. An educator
264| preparation institute choosing to offer a competency-based

265| certification program pursuant to the provisions of this section
266 must implement a program previously approved by the Department
267| of Education for this purpose or a program developed by the

268| institute and approved by the department for this purpose.

269| Approved programs shall be available for use by other approved
270| educator preparation institutes.

271 (a) Within 90 days after receipt of a request for

272| approval, the Department of Education shall approve a

273| preparation program pursuant to the requirements of this

274| gubsection or issue a statement of the deficiencies in the

275| request for approval. The department shall approve a

276| certification program if the institute provides evidence of the
277| dinstitute's capacity to implement a competency-based program
278| that includes each of the following:

279 l.a. Participant instruction and assessment in the Florida
280| Educator Accomplished Practices.

281 b. The state-adopted student content standards.

282 c. Scientifically researched reading instruction,

283| including explicit, systematic, and multisensory approaches to

284| reading instruction and intervention that are proven to improve

285| reading performance for all students.

286 d. Content literacy and mathematical practices.

Page 11 of 37
Reading PCB Workshop

CODING: Words stricken are deletions: words underlined are additions.




F L ORIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI VES

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR

287 e. Strategies appropriate for instruction of English

288 language learners.

289 f. Strategies appropriate for instruction of students with
290| disabilities.

291 g. School safety.

292 2. An educational plan for each participant to meet

293| certification requirements and demonstrate his or her ability to
294| teach the subject area for which the participant is seeking

295| certification, which is based on an assessment of his or her

296| competency in the areas listed in subparagraph 1.

297 3. Field experiences appropriate to the certification

298| subject area specified in the educational plan with a diverse
299| population of students in a variety of settings under the

300| supervision of qualified educators.

301 4. A certification ombudsman to facilitate the process and
302| procedures required for participants who complete the program to
303| meet any requirements related to the background screening

304| pursuant to s. 1012.32 and educator professional or temporary
305| certification pursuant to s. 1012.56.

306 (b) Each program participant must:

307 1. Meet certification requirements pursuant to s.

308| 1012.56(1) by obtaining a statement of status of eligibility in
309| the certification subject area of the educational plan and meet
310| the requirements of s. 1012.56(2) (a)-(f).

311 2. Participate in coursework and field experiences that

312| are appropriate to his or her educational plan prepared under

Page 12 of 37
Reading PCB Workshop

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



F LORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATIVE S

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR

313| paragraph (a), including reading instruction under s. 1012.567,

314| as applicable.

315 3. Before completion of the program, fully demonstrate his
316| or her ability to teach the subject area for which he or she is
317| seeking certification by documenting a positive impact on

318| student learning growth in a prekindergarten through grade 12
319| setting and achieving a passing score on the professional

320 education competency examination, the basic skills examination,
321| and the subject area examination for the subject area

322| certification which is required by state board rule.

323 Section 9. Section 1008.25, Florida Statutes, i1s amended
324 to read: '

325 1008.25 Public school student progression; student

326| support; reporting requirements.-—

327 (3) ALLOCATION OF RESOURCES.—District school boards shall
328 allocate remedial and supplemental instruction resources to

329| students in the following priority:

330 (a) Students who are deficient in reading by the end of
331| grade 3.

332 (b) Students who fail to meet performance levels required
333| for promotion consistent with the district school board's plan
334| for student progression required in subsection (2) paragraph
335 2by-.

336 (4) ASSESSMENT AND SUPPORT.-—

337 (b) A student who has a substantial reading deficiency as

338| determined by the school district or is not meeting theschool

Page 13 of 37
Reading PCB Workshop

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



F LORILIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI VES

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR

339| distrietor state requirements for satisfactory performance in
340| English Language Arts and mathematics must be covered by ene—ef
341 the-followingplans:

342 3+~ a & federally required student plan, such as an

343 individual education plans

344 2 —A scheoolwide systemof progress—monitering for all

345| students,—except—a student—who seeoresLevel4—orabove—on—-the
346| Eaglish Lenguage Arts—andmathematics—assessments—may—be

347| exemptedfrom-participationby the—prineipal; or

348 3— an An individualized progress monitoring plan; or both,

349 as necessary.

350 (5) READING DEFICIENCY AND PARENTAL NOTIFICATION.-—

351 (a) Any student in kindergarten through grade 3 who

352| exhibits a substantial deficiency in reading+ based upon locally

353| determined screening, diagnostic, progress monitoring, or

354| assessment data; or statewide assessments cenductedin
355| kindergartenor grade 1, —grade2—oF¥ grade—3;+ Or threough

356| teacher observations+ must be provided giwern intensive,

357 explicit, systematic, and multisensory reading interventions

358| dimstruetion immediately following the identification of the

359| reading deficiency. A school may not wait for a student to

360| receive a failing grade at the end of a grading period to

361| identify the student as having a substantial reading deficiency

362| and initiate intensive reading interventions. The student's

363| reading proficiency must be monitored and the intensive

364 interventions dmstruetion must continue until the student

Page 14 of 37
Reading PCB Workshop

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



F L ORIDA H O U S E O F REPRESENTATIVES

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR

365| demonstrates grade level proficiency in a manner determined by
366 the district, which may include achieving a Level 3 on the

367! statewide, standardized English Language Arts assessment.

368 (b) To be promoted to grade 4, a student must score a

369| Level 2 or higher on the statewide, standardized English

370| Language Arts assessment required under s. 1008.22 for grade 3.
371| If a student's reading deficiency is not remedied by the end of
372 grade 3, as demonstrated by scoring Level 2 or higher on the

373| statewide, standardized assessment required under s. 1008.22 for
374| grade 3, the student must be retained.

375 (c) The parent of any student who exhibits a substantial
376| deficiency in reading, as described in paragraph (a), must be
377| notified in writing of the following:

378 1. That his or her child has been identified as having a
379| substantial deficiency in reading.

380 2. A description of the current services that are provided
381| to the child.

382 3. A description of the proposed intensive interventions

383| supplementalinstructional serviees—and supports that will be
384| provided to the child that are designed to remediate the

385| identified area of reading deficiency.

386 4. That if the child's reading deficiency is not

387| remediated by the end of grade 3, the child must be retained
388| unless he or she is exempt from mandatory retention for good
389 cause.

390 5. A description and explanation, in terms understandable

Page 15 of 37
Reading PCB Workshop

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




FLORIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATIVES

391
392
393
394
395
396
397
398
399
400
401
402
403
404
405
406
407
408
409
410
411
412
413
414
415
416

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR
to the parent, of the exact nature of the student's difficulty
in learning and lack of achievement in reading and strategies
Strategies for parents to use in helping their child succeed in
reading proficiency, such as a “Read at Home” plan.

6. That the statewide, standardized English Language Arts
assessment is not the sole determiner of promotion and that
additional evaluations, portfolio reviews, and assessments are
available to the child to assist parents and the school district
in knowing when a child is reading at or above grade level and
ready for grade promotion.

7. The district's specific criteria and policies for a
portfolio as provided in subparagraph (6) (b)4. and the evidence
required for a student to demonstrate mastery of Florida's
academic standards for English Language Arts. A parent of a
student in grade 3 who is identified anytime during the year as
being at risk of retention may request that the school
immediately begin collecting evidence for a portfolio.

8. The district's specific criteria and policies for
midyear promotion. Midyear promotion means promotion of a
retained student at any time during the year of retention once
the student has demonstrated ability to read at grade level.
After initial notification, the school shall apprise the parent
of the student’s progress in response to the intensive
interventions and supports at least once every 2 weeks. These
communications must be in writing and must explain any

Page 16 of 37
Reading PCB Workshop

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underiined are additions.



FLORIDA H O U S E O F REPRESENTATIVES

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR

417| additional interventions or supports that will be used to

418 accelerate the student’s progress if strategies already being

419 implemented have not resulted in improvement.

420 (d) The Department of Education shall develop a handbook

421| that schools must provide to the parent of a student who is

422| identified as having a substantial reading deficiency. The

423 handbook must be made available in an electronic format that is

424| accessible online and must include the following information:

425 a. An overview of the requirements for interventions and

426| supports that districts must provide to students who do not make

427 adequate academic progress.

428 b. An overview of the procedural requirements for

429| initiating and conducting evaluations for exceptional education

430| eligibility. This must include an explanation that diagnosis of

431 a medical condition, alone, is not sufficient to establish

432| exceptional education eligibility but may be used to document

433| how that condition relates to the student’s eligibility

434 determination and may be disclosed in an eligible student’s

435| individualized education plan when necessary to inform school

436| personnel responsible for implementing the plan.

437 c. Characteristics of conditions associated with learning

438 disorders, including dyslexia, dysgraphia, dyscalculia, and

439 developmental aphasia.

440 d. A list of resources that support informed parent

441| involvement in decision-making processes for students who have

442| difficulty with learning.

Page 17 of 37
Reading PCB Workshop

CODING: Words stricken are deletions: words underlined are additions.




F LORIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATIVES

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR
443 (6) ELIMINATION OF SOCIAL PROMOTION.-—
444 (b) The district school board may only exempt students
445 from mandatory retention, as provided in paragraph (5) (b), for

446| good cause. A student who is promoted to grade 4 with a good

447| cause exemption shall be provided intensive reading instruction
448| and intervention that include specialized diagnostic information
449| and specific reading strategies to meet the needs of each

450| student so promoted. The school district shall assist schools

451| and teachers with the implementation of explicit, systematic,

452| and multisensory reading instruction and intervention strategies

453| for students promoted with a good cause exemption which research
454, has shown to be successful in improving reading among students
455 who have reading difficulties. Good cause exemptions are limited
456| to the following:

457 1. Limited English proficient students who have had less
458| than 2 years of instruction in an English for Speakers of Other
459| Languages program based on the initial date of entry into a

460| school in the United States.

461 2. Students with disabilities whose individual education
462| plan indicates that participation in the statewide assessment
463| program is not appropriate, consistent with the requirements of
464 s. 1008.212.

465 3. Students who demonstrate an acceptable level of

466| performance on an alternative standardized reading or English
467| Language Arts assessment approved by the State Board of

468| Education.

Page 18 of 37
Reading PCB Workshop

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



FLORIDA H O U § E O F R EPRESENTATI VES

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR

469 4. A student who demonstrates through a student portfolio
470| that he or she is performing at least at Level 2 on the

471 statewide, standardized English Language Arts assessment.

472 5. Students with disabilities who take the statewide,

473 standardized English Language Arts assessment and who have an
474 individual education plan or a Section 504 plan that reflects
475| that the student has received intensive instruction in reading
476| or English Language Arts for more than 2 years but still

477| demonstrates a deficiency and was previously retained in

478| kindergarten, grade 1, grade 2, or grade 3.

479 6. Students who have received intensive reading

480| intervention for 2 or more years but still demonstrate a

481| deficiency in reading and who were previously retained in

482 kindergarten, grade 1, grade 2, or grade 3 for a total of 2

483| vyears. A student may not be retained more than once in grade 3.
484
485
486
487

488
489| inelude—anatteredinstructional daythatincludes—specialized
490| diagresticinfermationand specific—reading strategies—for—each
491| student—The digtriet—school boardshallassist—schools—and

492 teachers—to—implement reading strategies—that resecareh—has——shewn
493
494

Page 19 of 37

Reading PCB Workshop
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATIVES

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR

495 (7) SUCCESSFUL PROGRESSION FOR RETAINED THIRD GRADE

496 STUDENTS .

497 (a) Students retained under the provisions of paragraph
498 (5) (b) must be provided intensive interventions in reading to

499| ameliorate the student's specific reading deficiency and prepare

500| the student for promotion to the next grade.;—asiderntified by =

501| walidandreliable-diagnosticassessment- These Thisintensive
502| interventions imtervention must include:

503 1. Evidence-based, explicit, systematic, and multisensory

504| reading instruction effeetiveinstruetienal in phonemic

505 awareness, phonics, fluency, vocabulary, and comprehension and

506| other strategies prescribed by the school district. strategies+

507 2. Participation partieipatien in the school district's

508 summer reading camp, which must incorporate the instructional

509 and intervention strategies under subparagraph 1l.—and

510

511 students—in becoming sucecessful readers,—able to¥readat—or
512

513 3. A minimum of 90 minutes of daily, uninterrupted,

514| reading instruction incorporating the instructional and

515| intervention strategies under subparagraph 1. This instruction

516| may include:

517 )—Fach—schooldistrictshalls

518 ———3-—Provide third grade gtudents-—who—are—retained under the
519 provisions—of paragraph {5 ){b)—withintensive instruectional

520 servicesand suppeorts—to-remediate the Fdentified areas—of

Page 20 of 37

Reading PCB Workshop
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



F L ORIDA H O U S E O F REPRESTENTATIVES

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR

521
522
523
524
525
526

527
528 a. Integration of science and social studies content

529 within the 90-minute block.

530 b. Small group instruction.

531 c¢. Reduced teacher-student ratios.

532 d. More frequent progress monitoring.

533 e. Tutoring or mentoring.

534 f. Transition classes containing 3rd and 4th grade

535 students.

536 g. Extended school day, week, or year.
537 (b) Each school district shall:
538 1.2~ Provide written notification to the parent of a

539| student who is retained under the provisions of paragraph (5) (b)
540| that his or her child has not met the proficiency level required
541| for promotion and the reasons the child is not eligible for a
542| good cause exemption as provided in paragraph (6) (b). The

543| notification must comply with the provisions of paragraph (5) (c)

544| s8+—3602-206435)> and must include a description of proposed

545 interventions and supports that will be provided to the child to

546| remediate the identified areas of reading deficiency.

Page 21 of 37
Reading PCB Workshop

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



FLORIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATIVES

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR

547 2.3~ Implement a policy for the midyear promotion of a
548| student retained under the provisions of paragraph (5) (b) who
549| can demonstrate that he or she is a successful and independent
550| reader and performing at or above grade level in reading or,
551| upon implementation of English Language Arts assessments,

552| performing at or above grade level in English Language Arts.
553| Tools that school districts may use in reevaluating a student
554| retained may include subsequent assessments, alternative

555| assessments, and portfolio reviews, in accordance with rules of
556| the State Board of Education. Students promoted during the

557| school year after November 1 must demonstrate proficiency levels
558| in reading equivalent to the level necessary for the beginning
559| of grade 4. The rules adopted by the State Board of Education
560/ must include standards that provide a reasonable expectation
561| that the student's progress is sufficient to master appropriate
562| grade 4 level reading skills.

563 3.4+~ Provide students who are retained under the

564| provisions of paragraph (5) (b) with a teacher certified or

565| endorsed in reading who is highly effective teaecher as

566| determined by the teacher's performance evaluation under s.
567 1012.34.

568 4.5+ Establish at each school, when applicable, an

569| intensive reading acceleration course Intensive-Aceceleration

570| €lass for any student retained in grade 3 students who was

571| previously retained in kindergarten, grade 1, or grade 2. whe
572 sﬁhsequeﬂ%%y;seefe—Leve%—%—eﬁ—%he—fequéfeé—s%a%ewideT
Page 22 of 37

Reading PCB Workshop
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



FLORILIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI VES

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR

573| standardized assessment—identified in-s-—31068-22—TFThefoecus—of
574| +the—Intensive AccelerationClass—shall -beto—inerease—a——echiid's
575| readingand-Brglish Language Arts—skill-ltevelat least—two—grade

576| Zlevels—in 31 -schoel year- The intensive reading acceleration
577| course Intensive Aecceleration Class must provide the following

578 shatl:

579 a. The integration of science and social studies content

580/ in a minimum of a 90-minute reading block.

581 b. Small group instruction.
582 c¢. Reduced teacher-student ratios.
583 d. The use of explicit, systematic, and multisensory

584| reading interventions, including intensive language and

585| vocabulary instruction and use of a speech-language therapist if

586| necessary, that has proven results in accelerating student

587| reading achievement within the same school year.

588 e. A "Read at Home" plan.

589 a—Be—provided—to—a student—in grade3—whoscores—hLevel—+%
590 on—the statewide,—standardized English anguageArts—assessment
591 andwho—was—retained in grade 3—the prier year because-of

592 seoringhLevel 1+

593 b— Have a-reduced—teacherstudent—ratio~

594 e—Provide—uninterrupted readinginstruction—for—the

595 maﬂ-eﬁe%ef—s%udeﬁ*&ee&eae%—&me—e&eh—éay—&&d—%eefpeﬁ% i i '

596 eppefEﬁﬁi%ies—%e—mas%ef—%he—gfaée—4—Nex%—@eﬁefa%ieﬂ—Suﬁshiﬁe
597 State Standards—in other-core subject—areas—

598 d— Use-—a—reading program thatis—seientifically researeh—

Page 23 of 37

Reading PCB Workshop
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



F L ORIDA H O U S E O F REPRESENTATIVES

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR

599| basedand has—proven—results—in acecelerating student—reading
600| achievementwithin the-same—school ear—

601 e— Provide intensive—language—and vocabularyinstruction
602| usinga scientifieally research-based-program,—incltuding use—of
603| a—speech—language—therapist-

604 (8) ANNUAL REPORT.-—

605 4> In addition to the requirements in paragraph (5) (b),
606| each district school board must annually report to the parent of
607| each student the progress of the student toward achieving state
608| and district expectations for proficiency in English Language
609 Arts, science, social studies, and mathematics. The district
610| school board must report to the parent the student's results on
611 each statewide, standardized assessment. The evaluation of each
612| student's progress must be based upon the student's classroom
613 work, observations, tests, district and state assessments,

614| response to intensive interventions provided under subparagraph

615 (5) (a), and other relevant information. Progress reporting must
616 be provided to the parent in writing in a format adopted by the
617| district school board.

618 Section 10. Subsection (5) of section 1008.345, Florida
619 Statutes, is amended to read:

620 1008.345 Implementation of state system of school

621| improvement and education accountability.—

622 (5) The commissioner shall annually report to the State

623| Board of Education and Legislature and recommend changes in

624 state policy necessary to foster school improvement and

Page 24 of 37
Reading PCB Workshop

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATIVES

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR

625| education accountability. The report shall include:

626 (a) For each school district:

627 1. The percentage of students, by school and grade level,
628 demonstrating learning growth in English Language Arts and

629| mathematics.

630 2. The percentage of students, by school and grade level,
631| 1in both the highest and lowest quartiles demonstrating learning
632| growth in English Language Arts and mathematics.

633 3. The district school board’s policies and procedures on

634| student retention and promotion.

635 4. By grade, the number and percentage of all students in

636| grades 3 through 10 performing at each level on the statewide,

637 standardized English Language Arts assessment.

638 5. By grade, the number and percentage of all students

639| retained in kindergarten through grade 10.

640 6. Information on the total number of students who were

641| promoted for good cause, by each category of good cause as

642| specified in s. 1008.25(6) (b).

643 7. Any revisions to the district school board’s policies

644| and procedures on student retention and promotion from the prior

645 year.

646 (b) Intervention and support strategies used by school
647| districts beards whose students in both the highest and lowest
648| quartiles exceed the statewide average learning growth for

649| students in those quartiles.

650 (c) Intervention and support strategies used by school

Page 25 of 37
Reading PCB Workshop

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F REPRESENTATIVE S

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR

651| boards whose schools provide educational services to youth in
652| Department of Juvenile Justice programs that demonstrate

653| learning growth in English Language Arts and mathematics that
654| exceeds the statewide average learning growth for students in
655| those subjectsﬂ

656 (d) Based upon a review of each district’s reading plan

657| submitted pursuant to 1011.62(9), intervention and support

658| strategies used by school districts that were effective in

659| improving the reading performance of students, as indicated by

660 student performance data, who are identified as having a

661| substantial reading deficiency pursuant to s. 1008.25(5) (a),

662 F.S.

663
664| School reports shall be distributed pursuant to this subsection
665 and s. 1001.42(18) (c) and according to rules adopted by the

666| State Board of Education.

667 Section 11. Subsection (2) of section 1011.67, Florida
668| Statutes, is amended to read:

669 1011.67 Funds for instructional materials.-—

670 (2)

671| (a) Annually by July 1 and prior to the release of

672 instructional materials funds, each district school

673| superintendent shall certify to the Commissioner of Education
674| that the district school board has approved a comprehensive

675| staff development plan that supports fidelity of implementation
676 of instructional materials programs, including —The—report

Page 26 of 37
Reading PCB Workshop

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F REPRESENTATIVES

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR

677| shall—inelude verification that training was provided; and that

678 the materials are being implemented as designed; and, for core

679| reading materials and supplemental intervention reading

680| materials used in kindergarten through grade 5, that the

681| materials have been identified by the Just Read, Florida! Office

682| as meeting the requirements of s. 1001.215(11). Certification

683| that the school district uses core instructional reading

684| materials identified by the Just Read, Florida! Office pursuant

685| to s. 1001.215(11) is not required until April 1, 2019. This

686| paragraph does not preclude school districts from purchasing or

687| using other materials to supplement reading instruction and

688| provide additional skills practice.

689 (b) Each district superintendent shall, as part of the

690| certification under paragraph (a), report the number and

691| percentage of the district’s K-5 instructional personnel who

692| have received training to implement the core and supplemental

693 intervention reading materials. The district superintendent

694| shall also report the process by which the remaining K-5

695| personnel will be provided the training, including those newly

696| hired by the district.

697 Section 12. Section 1012.567, Florida Statutes, is created
698 to read:

699 1012.567 Certification and endorsement for elementary

700| reading instructors.—

701 (1) CERTIFICATION.—
702 (a) Beginning January 1, 2017, any candidate for an
Page 27 of 37
Reading PCB Workshop

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



F L ORIDA H O U S E O F REPRESENTATIVES

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR

703| educator certificate in an area involving reading instruction or

704| intervention for any students in kindergarten through grade 6

705| must, as part of the certification process, demonstrate

706| competence in the following:

707 1. Identifying characteristics of conditions such as

708| dyslexia and other causes of diminished phonological processing

709 skills;

710 2. Using explicit, systematic, and multisensory approaches

711| to reading instruction and intervention that are proven to

712| improve reading performance for all students;

713 3. Using predictive data to make instructional decisions

714 based on individual student needs.

715

716| The State Board of Education shall adopt in rule minimum

717| requirements for instruction provided by teacher preparation

718| programs and school districts for this purpose.

719 (b) Documentation of a valid professional standard

720| teaching certificate issued by another state is not sufficient

721| to meet the requirements of paragraph (a). The State Board of

722| Education shall establish a procedure by which a candidate who

723 holds a certificate issued by another state may demonstrate

724| competence as required under paragraph (a).

725 (c) The State Board of Education shall identify in rule

726 certification areas in which candidates must demonstrate

727| competence as provided in paragraph (a) as part of the

728| certification process.

Page 28 of 37
Reading PCB Workshop

CODING: Words siricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



FLORIDA H O U § E O F R EPRESENTATIV

729
730
731
732
733
734
735
736
737
738
739
740
741
742
743
744
745
746
747
748
749
750
751
752
753
754

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR

(d) To receive initial or continued approval, a teacher

preparation program under s. 1004.04 or s. 1004.85 must provide

instruction in the skills and strategies enumerated in paragraph

(a) to candidates for certificates in the areas identified

pursuant to paragraph (c).

(2) ENDORSEMENT.—Beginning January 1, 2017, the

specialization requirements for an endorsement in reading must

include at least 3 semester hours of instruction in explicit,

systematic, and multisensory approaches to reading instruction

and intervention that are proven to improve reading performance

for all students. This instruction may be incorporated into

semester hour requirements already established in state board

rule as of July 1, 2016.

(3) REVIEW.—By July 1, 2017, and at least once every five

years thereafter, the department shall conduct a review of

specialization and coverage area requirements in the elementary,

reading, and exceptional student educational areas. At the

conclusion of each review, the department shall recommend to the

State Board of Education changes to the specialization and

coverage area requirements based upon any identified

instructional or intervention strategies proven to improve

student reading performance.

(4) STATE BOARD RULES.— The State Board of Education shall

adopt rules pursuant to ss. 120.536 and 120.54, as necessary, to

implement this section.

Section 13. Paragraph (a) is amended and paragraph (f) is

Page 29 of 37

Reading PCB Workshop
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




F L ORIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATIV

755
756
757
758
759
760
761
762
763
764
765
766
767
768
769
770
771
772
773
774
775
776
777
778
779
780

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR

added to subsection (3) of section 1012.585, Florida Statutes,
to read:

1012.585 Process for renewal of professional
certificates.—

(3) For the renewal of a professional certificate, the
following requirements must be met:

(a) The applicant must earn a minimum of 6 college credits
or 120 inservice points or a combination thereof. For each area
of specialization to be retained on a certificate, the applicant
must earn at least 3 of the required credit hours or equivalent
inservice points in the specialization area. Education in
"clinical educator" training pursuant to s. 1004.04(5) (b) and
credits or points that provide training in the area of
scientifically researched, knowledge-based reading literacy,

including explicit, systematic, and multisensory approaches to

reading instruction and intervention; and computational skills

acquisition;+ exceptional student education;+ normal child
development;+ and the disorders of development may be applied
toward any specialization area. Credits or points that provide
training in the areas of drug abuse, child abuse and neglect,
strategies in teaching students having limited proficiency in
English, or dropout prevention, or training in areas identified
in the educational goals and performance standards adopted
pursuant to ss. 1000.03(5) and 1008.345 may be applied toward

any specialization area, except specialization areas identified

by the State Board of Education as involving reading instruction

-

Page 30 of 37

Reading PCB Workshop
CODING; Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




F L ORIDA H O U S E O F REPRESENTATIVES

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR

781| or intervention for any students in kindergarten through grade 6

782| under s. 1012.567(1) (c). Credits or points earned through

783| approved summer institutes may be applied toward the fulfillment
784| of these requirements. Inservice points may also be earned by
785| participation in professional growth components approved by the
786| State Board of Education and specified pursuant to s. 1012.98 in
787| the district's approved master plan for inservice educational

788| training; however, such points may not be used to satisfy the

789| specialization requirements of this paragraph;—ineluding—but
790 not—limited-to,—serving as—a trainer in-anapproved—teacher

791 Efaiﬁiﬂg—ae%ivi%yT—sefviﬁg—eﬁ—aﬁ—éﬁs%fﬁe%iena}—ma%efia}s
792 committee—ora—state-board orcommissionthatdeals—with

793| educational issues,—or-Serving onan—advisory-council—ereated
794 pursvant—to—s5+—31661+-452.

795 (f) Beginning January 1, 2017, an applicant for renewal of

796| a professional certificate, in any area of certification

797| identified in rule by the State Board of Education pursuant to

798| s. 1012.567(1) (¢), must earn a minimum of 2 college credits or

799| the equivalent inservice points in the use of explicit,

800| systematic, and multisensory approaches to reading instruction

801| and intervention. Such training must be provided by teacher

802 preparation programs under ss. 1004.04 or 1004.85 or approved

803 school district professional development systems under s.

804| 1012.98. The requirement in this paragraph may not add to the

805| total hours required by the department for continuing education

806| or inservice training.

Page 31 of 37
Reading PCB Workshop

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




F LORI DA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATIVES

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR

807 Section 14. Subsection (1) of section 1012.586, Florida
808 Statutes, is amended to read:

809 1012.586 Additions or changes to certificates; duplicate
810| certificates.—A school district may process via a Department of
811| Education website certificates for the following applications of
812| public school employees:

813 (1) Addition of a subject coverage or endorsement to a

814| valid Florida certificate on the basis of the completion of the
815| appropriate subject area testing requirements of s.

816 1012.56(5) (a) or the completion of the requirements of an

817| approved school district program or the inservice components for

818! an endorsement. To reduce duplication, the department may

819| recommend consolidation of endorsement areas and requirements to

820 the State Board of Education.

821
822| The employing school district shall charge the employee a fee
823 not to exceed the amount charged by the Department of Education
824| for such services. Each district school board shall retain a

825| portion of the fee as defined in the rules of the State Board of
826 Education. The portion sent to the department shall be used for
827| maintenance of the technology system, the web application, and
828| posting and mailing of the certificate.

829 Section 15. Paragraph (e) of subsection (3) is added, and
830| paragraph (b) of subsection (4) of section 1012.98, Florida

831| Statutes, is amended to read:

832 1012.98 School Community Professional Development Act.-—

Page 32 of 37
Reading PCB Workshop

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



F L ORIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI VES

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR
833
834 (3) The activities designed to implement this section
835 must:
836 (e) Provide all elementary grades instructional personnel

837| without a reading endorsement training sufficient to earn the

838| endorsement before renewal or attainment of a professional

839 certificate pursuant to ss. 1012.56 or s. 1012.585.

840 (4) The Department of Education, school districts,

841 schools, Florida College System institutions, and state

842| universities share the responsibilities described in this

843| section. These responsibilities include the following:

844 (b) Each school district shall develop a professional

845| development system as specified in subsection (3). The system
846| shall be developed in consultation with teachers, teacher-

847| educators of Florida College System institutions and state

848 universities, business and community representatives, and local
849 education foundations, consortia, and professional

850| organizations. The professional development system must:

851 1. Be approved by the department. All substantial

852| revisions to the system shall be submitted to the department for
853 review for continued approval.

854 2. Be based on analyses of student achievement data and
855| instructional strategies and methods that support rigorous,

856| relevant, and challenging curricula for all students. Schools
857| and districts, in developing and refining the professional

858 development system, shall also review and monitor school

Page 33 of 37
Reading PCB Workshop

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



F L ORIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATIVES

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR

859 discipline data; school environment surveys; assessments of

860| parental satisfaction; performance appraisal data of teachers,
861| managers, and administrative personnel; and other performance
862| indicators to identify school and student needs that can be met
863| by improved professional performance.

864 3. Provide inservice activities coupled with followup

865| support appropriate to accomplish district-level and school-
866| level improvement goals and standards. The inservice activities
867| for instructional personnel shall focus on analysis of student
868 achievement data, ongoing formal and informal assessments of
869 student achievement, identification and use of enhanced and

870| differentiated instructional strategies that emphasize rigor,
871 relevance, and reading in the content areas, enhancement of

872| subject content expertise, integrated use of classroom

873 technology that enhances teaching and learning, classroom

874| management, parent involvement, and school safety.

875 4. 1Include a master plan for inservice activities,

876 pursuant to rules of the State Board of Education, for all

877| district employees from all fund sources. The master plan shall
878| be updated annually by September 1, must be based on input from
879 teachers and district and school instructional leaders, and must
880| use the latest available student achievement data and research
881 to enhance rigor and relevance in the classroom. Each district
882 inservice plan must be aligned to and support the school-based
883| inservice plans and school improvement plans pursuant to s.

884| 1001.42(18). Each district inservice plan must provide a

Page 34 of 37
Reading PCB Workshop

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



F L ORTILIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATIVES

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR

885| description of the training that middle grades instructional

886| personnel and school administrators receive on the district's
887| code of student conduct adopted pursuant to s. 1006.07;

888| integrated digital instruction and competency-based instruction
889| and CAPE Digital Tool certificates and CAPE industry

890 certifications; classroom management; student behavior and

891| interaction; extended learning opportunities for students; and
892| instructional leadership. District plans must be approved by the
893| district school board annually in order to ensure compliance

894| with subsection (1) and to allow for dissemination of research-
895| based best practices to other districts. District school boards
896| must submit verification of their approval to the Commissioner
897| of Education no later than October 1, annually. Each school

898| principal may establish and maintain an individual professional
899| development plan for each instructional employee assigned to the
900| school as a seamless component to the school improvement plans
901| developed pursuant to s. 1001.42(18). An individual professional
902| development plan must be related to specific performance data
903| for the students to whom the teacher is assigned, define the

904| inservice objectives and specific measurable improvements

905| expected in student performance as a result of the inservice

906| activity, and include an evaluation component that determines
907| the effectiveness of the professional development plan.

908 5. Include inservice activities for school administrative
909| personnel that address updated skills necessary for

910| instructional leadership and effective school management

Page 35 of 37
Reading PCB Workshop

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



F LORIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATIVES

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR

911| pursuant to s. 1012.986.

912 6. Provide for systematic consultation with regional and
913| state personnel designated to provide technical assistance and
914| evaluation of local professional development programs.

915 7. Provide for delivery of professional development by

916| distance learning and other technology-based delivery systems to
917| reach more educators at lower costs.

918 8. Provide for the continuous evaluation of the quality
919| and effectiveness of professional development programs in order
920; to eliminate ineffective programs and strategies and to expand
921| effective ones. Evaluations must consider the impact of such

922| activities on the performance of participating educators and

923| their students' achievement and behavior.

924 9. For middle grades, emphasize:

925 a. Interdisciplinary planning, collaboration, and

926| instruction.

927 b. Alignment of curriculum and instructional materials to
928| the state academic standards adopted pursuant to s. 1003.41.

929 c. Use of small learning communities; problem-solving,

930| inquiry-driven research and analytical approaches for students;
931| strategies and tools based on student needs; competency-based
932 instruction; integrated digital instruction; and project-based
933| instruction.

934
935| Each school that includes any of grades 6, 7, or 8 must include

936| in its school improvement plan, required under s. 1001.42(18), a

Page 36 of 37
Reading PCB Workshop

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATIVE S

BILL ORIGINAL YEAR

937| description of the specific strategies used by the school to
938| implement each item listed in this subparagraph.

939 10. Provide training to reading coaches, classroom

940 teachers, and school administrators in effective methods of

941| identifying characteristics of conditions such as dyslexia and

942| other causes of diminished phonological processing skills;

943| incorporating instructional techniques into the general

944| education setting that are proven to improve reading performance

945 for all students; and using predictive data to make

946 instructional decisions based on individual student needs. The

947| training must help teachers to integrate phonemic awareness;

948 phonics, word study, and spelling; reading fluency; vocabulary,

949| including academic vocabulary; and text comprehension strategies

950| into an explicit, systematic, and multisensory approach to

951| reading instruction and intervention.

952 Section 16. This act shall take effect July 1, 2016.

Page 37 of 37
Reading PCB Workshop

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



